BID TABULATION SHEET

JOB NAME:

O'Fallon 1MG Elevated
Water Storage Tanks

CONTRACTORS

OWNER:

City of O'Fallon, lllinois

BID OPENING:

8:30 a.m., February 27, 2008

ENGINEER'S OPINION OF COST

Phoenix Fabricators & Erectors,Inc
1329 Hwy. 41 North
Sebree, KY 42455

5% Bid Bond

Caldwell Tanks, Inc
4000 Tower Road
Louisville, KY 40219

5% Bid Bond

CB&l Constructors, Inc.
4109 South Route 59
Plainfield, IL 60544

5% Bid Bond

Item

Quantity

Unit Price

Amount

Unit Price

Amount

Unit Price

Amount

Unit Price

Amount

BASE BID

Composite Elevated Water Storage
Tank and Appurtenances (including
all associated site improvements
and utilities services)

- Kyle Road Site

LS

$  2,350,000.00

LS

$ 2,916,000.00

LS

No Bid

LS

$ 3,200,000.00

Composite Elevated Water Storage
Tank and Appurtenances (including
all associated site improvements
and utilities services)

- Pausch Road Site

LS

$  2,150,000.00

LS

$ 2,775,600.00

LS

No Bid

LS

$ 3,030,000.00

BASE BID - LUMP SUM COST

TOTAL

$  4,500,000.00

$ 5,691,600.00

No Bid

$ 6,230,000.00

ALTERNATE BID

Steel Fluted Column Elevated
Water Storage Tank and
Appurtenances (including all
associated site improvements and
utilities services) - Kyle Road Site

LS

Not estimated

LS

No Bid

LS

$2,970,700.00

LS

$ 2,710,000.00

Steel Fluted Column Elevated
Water Storage Tank and
Appurtenances (including all
associated site improvements and
utilities services) - Pausch Road

LS

Not estimated

LS

No Bid

LS

$2,777,300.00

LS

$ 2,555,000.00

ALTERNATE BID - LUMP SUM
COST

TOTAL

Not estimated

No Bid

$ 5,748,000.00

$ 5,265,000.00
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